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Resolute Investment Managers Hires New Head of Retail Sales 

 
Ted Wozniak Joins $79 Billion Asset Management Platform as  

Vice President and Head of Retail Sales 
 
IRVING, Texas – October 15, 2024 –  Resolute Investment Managers, Inc. (“Resolute”), a 
diversified, multi-affiliate asset management platform with more than 30 affiliated and 
independent relationships, announced today that Ted Wozniak has been hired as vice president 
and head of Retail Sales, effective October 1.   
 
Mr. Wozniak has almost 30 years of experience working within the asset management industry. 
Previously, he served as the head of U.S. Asset Management Distribution at SEI Investments Co., a 
global investment manager that manages, advises or administers approximately $1.5 trillion in 
assets.  
 
Greg Stumm, president and CEO of Resolute and its affiliate, American Beacon Advisors, said: “We 
are thrilled to welcome Ted to the team. His expertise and proven track record in retail distribution 
make him an ideal fit for our firm as we continue to grow and scale our core competencies. Ted will 
play a vital role in driving our growth strategy across our top-tier distribution center, supporting 
partnership management and overseeing the field sales team across the retail channel.” 
 
Mr. Wozniak said: “It’s a very exciting time to join Resolute – and an equally exciting time to be in 
the retail investment industry. As the landscape continues to evolve, Resolute’s strong reputation 
and ability to scale will be instrumental as we continue building and offering innovative strategies 
that meet the needs of modern investors.”  
 
Mr. Wozniak will report directly to Mr. Stumm. 
 
Mr. Wozniak graduated from King’s College in Pennsylvania, where he earned a bachelor’s degree 
in Finance. He is a CFA® charterholder and holds FINRA Series 7, 24 and 66 licenses. 
 
About Resolute Investment Managers  
Resolute Investment Managers, Inc. is a diversified, multi-affiliate asset management platform with 
affiliated and independent relationships with more than 30 investment managers. Driven by future 
value creation, Resolute offers a unique platform that delivers strategic benefits through a full suite 
of distribution, operational and administrative services that may be leveraged by its affiliates. With 
roots as an unaffiliated sub-advised mutual fund sponsor, the majority of Resolute’s partnerships 
are with asset managers who invest and operate with full autonomy and independence. Resolute’s 
affiliates include American Beacon Advisors, Inc.; National Investment Services of America, LLC; 
RSW Investments Holdings, LLC; Shapiro Capital Management LLC and SSI Investment 



Management LLC. As of June 30, 2024, the affiliated companies of Resolute had $79.3 billion in 
assets under management. For more information, please visit www.resolutemanagers.com.  
 
About American Beacon Advisors  
American Beacon Advisors, Inc., an investment affiliate of Resolute Investment Managers, Inc., is 
an experienced provider of investment advisory services to institutional and retail markets. 
Established in 1986, American Beacon Advisors serves defined benefit plans, defined contribution 
plans, foundations, endowments, corporations and other institutional investors, as well as retail 
clients. The firm also provides corporate cash management and fixed-income separate account 
management. American Beacon Advisors manages the American Beacon Funds, a series of 
competitively priced mutual funds and exchange-traded funds. The Funds employ a “manager of 
managers” investment style and currently include international and domestic equity, fixed income 
and money market funds. As of June 30, 2024, American Beacon Advisors had approximately $60 
billion in assets under management. For more information, 
visit www.americanbeaconadvisors.com.  
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